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Internat ional  R es€arch
Award for Dalhousie

Dental Student.
Last year the International
Association for Dental research
introduced the David B. Scott
Student Research Fel lowship.
It is with rnuch pleasure that
the Research l.{ews reports that
ons of our Dalhousie tlniversity
third year Dental  under-
graduate students Kerim M.
Ozcan is the recipient of this
very prestigious International
award. Each member country
of the IADR takes it in turn to
select a, student for this award,
1990 is Canada's turn. 'We will
not have another chance to
compe te in this competit ion
until the year 2407 in 17 years
tirne. Kerim's name will go
down in history as the first
Canadian to receive this award,
and it is going to be many
years before we have a second
Canadian winner. The award is
qui te generous being worth
$2,500 US. Kerim wil l  be
presented with this award at
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the opening ceremony of the
IADR meeting in Cincinnati in
March 1990. Only lst, Znd and
3rd year dental students in
Canadian Universi t ies were
eligible for the competit iolt.
The Prest igious International
David Scott Award will provide
the incentive for Kerim t0
choose dental research as his
future career. The 'Internat-
ional Award' is a just reward
for Kerirn's hard work and
brings credit to the F4culty." of
Dentistry and to Dalhousie
Universi  ty . Ker im has a
B achelor of Science Honours
Degree in Biology, and has
worked for two summers a$ a
Research Assi$tant in the
Biomaterials Science laboratory.
Kerim is conducting an Elective
Research Programme with Dr's.
D.W. Jones and 'W.C. Foong, this
proj ec t  inv olves an inve st-
igation of the incorporation of
various pharmacological agents
into soft polymer gel systems
to provide slow drug release. '
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David B. Scott Award
This year Ker im Qzcan
pr"esented a paper based on
some of the biomater ia ls
polymer research conducted
during his elective programme
at the 67th IADR rneeting in
Dublin in July 1989. A firther
paper has also been submitted
to the IADR meeting to be held
in Cincinnati, for March 1990, if
accepted Kerim will once again
be presenting a paper at the
top internat ion al  scient i f ic
dental meeting.

The report last year from
the Comrnit tee on Under-
graduate Education at Dalhousie
sug g e s ts that  we sh ould
emphasize the importance that
Dalhousie attaches to teaching
as well as to research, and we
should promote the integration
of the two. The committee's
report also emphasizes that
students should have the
opportunity to learn of the
re'search role of their faculty,
especial ly through direct
involvement in that research.
The Faculty of Dentistry can
feel  j  us t ly  proud of  the
excellent involvement of our
dental  students in facul ty
research. The David Scott
award given to Kerim Ozcan can
be seen as a reward and tribute
to all of our excellent Dalhousie
Dental  students who have
participated in our research
during the past several years.
Our dental student population
of today is a very important

source of  future dental
scientists. The involvement of
students in our research within
the faculty is one way of
making a contribution to the
future of dental science in
Canada. Kerim Ozcan's research
experience at Dathousie may
pave the way for a dental
sclence career. I t  is
encouraging to know that by
involving our dental students
in our s urnmer re search
projects we stand a chance of
improving the future for
clinical scientists.

A study has found a
posit ive correlat ion between
exposure to research during
professional degree studies and
the development of a career in
which research is a maj or
activity, (Can Med. Ass. J. Dec.
lst 88). We hope that the
David B. Scott Student Research
Fellowship award' wil l  t lrelp
Kerim Qzcan to decide that he
has a future as an applied
scientists. As such he will join
that segment of the profession
of dentistry who must seek out
new knowledge in order to
better serv e mankind and
contr ibute to the body of
scient i f ic  dental  knowledge.
The national and international
reputation of Dalhousie in the
field of dental research and
scholarship stands very high
indeed. The Scott  Award
represents a fantastic success
for Kerim Ozcan and indeed for
all of our student researchers.
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Centres of Excellence
The federal government have
fiqatly put u$ out of our misery
and announced the result of the
$240 mil l ion funded prog-
ramme for the Centres' of
Excellence. Unfortunately our
National Biomaterials Prog-
rarnrne was not one of the 14
programrnes selected out of the
238 letters of intent and the
158 final submissions. Cong-
ratulat ions are due to
Dalhousie's success with the
'OPEN' network dealing with
the fisheries and to Dr. Jurgen
Kreuzer of Dalhousie's Physics
Department who will head up
one of the nodes of the Centre
of Excellence in Molecular and
Interfacial  Dynamic s.  In
addi t ion Dalhousie have
investigators in the Neural
Regeneration and Functional
Recovery centre at Mcci l l
University. The success of Dr.
Kreuzer's group is particularly
important to our research in
biomaterials since he is a
collaborator in our biomaterials
group. Thus the development
of the Molecular Interfacial
Dynamics project wi l l  have
part ic ul  ar  v alue and add
signif icant strength to our
research in biomaterials as well
as providing considerable
support  for  our proposed
Graduate Programme
Biofiraterials Science.
interfacial  contact

in
The

of
biomaterials and tissues is a
very irnportant aspect which

involves both the functional
and biocompatibility success of
biomaterials and implants,

The other successful
Centres of  Excel lence
programrne "OPEN' can also be
indirectly beneficial to our
biomaterials programme. Leo
Vining of  the Biology
Department at  Dalhousie
University who was one of the
Principal Investigators on our
B iomater ia l  s Centres of
Exsel lence proposnl ,  has,
together with colleague Dr. J. M.
Wright and others received a
Strategic Grant f rom the
Natural Science and Engin-
eering Research Council to
invest igate potent ia l  b io-
adhesives derived from marine
organisms. The development of
bioadhe sive s and wound
dressings is one of the research
areas in our biomater ia ls
research programme.- iThe
'OPEN' f isheries project is
inv olved with research
involving scallops and as such
will benefit Dr. Vinnings work
on bioadhesives from marine
organisms. This will in turn be
beneficial to our own work
involving bioadhesive cement
systems. These developments
are good news indeed for our
biomaterial  s graduate prog -
ramme proposal. The new
Centres of Excellence Prog-
rarnmes at Dalhousie lend
support to our research which
involves the manipulation of

(cont. on page 4.)
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Centres of Excellence
(cont. from page 3.)

matter at the molecular level
by the synthesis of inorganic
and organic compounds
suitable for use as biomaterials.
Such research is central to the
proposed biomaterials graduate
programme,

The team of workers
involved with the Biomaterials
Centres of Excellence submi-
ssion twelve months ago
perf  ormed w onders in
producing an excellent final
document. The fifteen princ-
ipal investigators collectively
had a total  of  1 ,600
pu bl  ic  at i  on s i  n refere ed
journals and over $5 ,million in
current research grants. S/e
believe that we had a, very
strong application with good
science and good researchers.
Even though our Biomaterials
programme was not successful
in obtaining funding at this
time, rve can at least claim to
have forged some excellent
I  on g last in g c ol laborat iv e
research relat ionships across
the Dalhousie campus, across
Nova Scotia and across the
country. We have clear
evidence to show that the
many long hours spent on this
Centres of Excellence project
were not for nothing .

\ t r /e have recent ly
submitted at very short notice
a Biomaterials proposal as part
of the federal initiative for the
$22 million Japanese-Canadian

Joint  Research Programme.
This submission wa$ only
possible be cause of  the
excellent preparation for the
previous federal Centres of
Excellence Programrne.

Review of Proposed
Biomaterials Graduate

Programme
On the 10th and 1l th of
November 1989 an external
review took place as part of the
evaluation of of the proposed
graduate progta,mrne
Biomater ia ls Science.

in
In

addition to the three person
Senate Committee a total of 26
indiv iduals met wi th Dr.
Thomp son the extern al
reviewer during his two day
visi t .

BESpARCH NEWS orI FrLE
Please note that a complete
collection of all previous copies
of the Dental Research News
publ ished since September
1987, are on file in the Faculty
Lounge in a green file folder.

Do you have any research news
which you would like to share
with your colleagues?. If so,
please forward such items to
the Re searc h Dev eloprnen t
Office. I t  would help i f
submissions were produced on
a (Macintosh) disc in Microsoft
Word, or simply call 1675.
?s8aa as?s ?FEr?s6?s?s a
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Old Teeth
Archaeologists at the Museurn
of " London are working on one
of the biggest finds of skeletons
from the medieval period. The
discovery of a cemetery from
the time of the Black Death on
the old Royal Mint site near the
Tower of London in 1987 has
excited archaeologists, who say
the find is more important than
the col lect ion of  sai lors '
skeletons found on the Mary
Ro$o, Henery VIII's flagship
that sank in the Solent in 1545.
The cemetery gives the finest
example of a cross-section of
medieval British life, with rich
poor, young and old buried
together within 18 months of
the plague reaching London in
September 1348" The findings
reveal that medieval man was
not short, fat and hairy, with
warts on his face and a leering
grin which tends fo be the false
picture of our forefathers,
passed down through imperfect
history books and
impressionistic paintings. The
typical medieval Briton was
similar in stature to many of
todays workers in City of
London offices near the spot
where hundreds of people were
buried in mass graves during
the bubonic plague in 1349"
Of dental interest is the finding
that these individuals had a
fuller mouth , a leg acy of
coarser foods which rcquired
prolonged chewing which
would stimulate iaw bone

growth. The teeth werc found
to be largely free frorn decay.
The archeologists have found
that our ancestors lived longer
than is commonly believed for
the period and had fewer cases
of arthritis than expected by
bone special ists. These
rnedieval people also suffered
fewer cases of bone fractures
which might result from falls or
from violence. The diet of
bread, meat, fi$h, cheese and
ale, may have contributed to
the fewer signs of tooth decay.
Duncan Hawkins, one of three
archaelogists who supervised
the f,1m dig, said: "It wil l
provide a unique picture of
medieval man." The skeletons
lue to be subjected to DNA tests
to take genetic f ingerprints
from the bone which can
indicate sex and race. Oxygen
isotope analysis will measure
the carbons laid in the bone s
by various foods to deterrnine
diets " O steologists at the
Museum of Londotr ,  are
cataloguing the skeletons and
taking measurements to assess
whether the victirns had broad
facos, high foreheads, back
problemsn or iron deficiencies.
They claim that the work could
dernythologise the Middle Ages.
in which we think of men
being 4ft nothing and dying at
35. This may wel l  be
inaccurate. Dr. 'Waldron, a
London consultant physician,
said half the skeletons he had

(cont. page 6).
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Old Teeth
(cont. from page 5).

seen showed signs of arthritis,
but it affected people less than
he had expected. One
extraordinary finding was the
man stabbed in the back with a
huge downward blow which
embedded the knife-end in two
vertabrae, I larrowly missing
the spinal cord. Amazingly, he
survived only to die in the
plague a few years later. The
last of the 700 skeletons to be
excavated was found together
with 100 si lver coios, but
other wealthy victims of the
plague were no so lucky. Many
were stripped of everything
except their  shrouds.
Gravediggers of the period,
could become very rich" In
contrast  bone surgeons,
restorat ive dent ists and
periodontists i t  would seem
would be out of work. The
larger jaw would also exclude
the need for orthodontics. fn
medieval Britain the need for
biomaterials was yet to emerge.

Pnofessipnql
"The crucial  d ist inct ion
between a profession and a
non-professional occupation is
that the skills characterizing a
profession are derived from
and supported by a body of
knowledge which has been
val idated via the scient i f ic
method". (8. Greenwood -
"Attributes of a Profession "
Social Work 2:45-55, 1957).

Datps .foJ Yf'uf , Calendar

Grant Deadlines
MRCr{Jniversi tyalndustry
Operat ing and Equipment
Grants competit ion deadline,
lst March 1990.

Deadlines for regular MRC
Operating Grants:

New-September 1st, 1990
Renewal-November lsto 1990
Equipment-September 15th
and November lst 1990

MRC - History of Health
Sciences deadline October l st
1 990.

NHRDP: Deadl ines for
submission of new projects
December l st 1990.

Applications must be submitted
on NHRDP-I catalogue number
NHW 606 (08-84). If approved
funding will be effective on or
after the following July-

Meet in,g s
IADR, General  Session and
AADR Annual Session, March
7th-1lth 1990, Cincinnati, Ohio.

IADR, General  Session and
AADR Annual Session, Apri l
17 th-21st 1991, Acapulco,
Mexico

IADRn General Session 1992,
Glasgow, UK.

AADR, Annual Session, March
11th-15th 1992, Boston, Mass,

IADR, General Session and
AADR Annual Session, March
1Oth-14th 1993, Chicsgo, Il l.
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Clinical Trials
Enormous interest was
gsnerated by the first Lunch
Time Research Seminar of the
Year held on the 4th of October.
The topic was the Design of
Clinical Trials. A total of 15
individuals turned up for the
discussion. The aim was to
build upon the experience
gained at  the Research
Sforkshop held in conjunction
with the ACFD Biennial
Conference last June, in London
Ontario. It was agreed by the
group present to hold a, serie s
of (neetings to continue the
review and discussion and
exchangs of ideas on the topic.
The objective being to try to
come up with one or two
formats for clinical trials, which
could serve as examples. It
was fel t  that by working
through the proces s and
discussing the various details in
depth a better understanding
would be achieved. The
informal srnall group discussion
was found to be an ideal forum
for this rype of topic. A list of
references were circulated and
it was agreed that these would
serve in the first instance as a
starting point for review and
discussion. A total of four such
meetings have now been held
on this topic, these have proved
to be very valuable and
st imulat ing on this very
important clinical topic.

Serious Problem
As university academics and
scient ists we face a very
ser ious problem in todays
rnodern wor ld wi th vast
amounts of new information
being generated so rapidly.
John Ziman has put it very well
when he points out that "The
most serious problem, from the
point of view of the practising
scientist, is to keep up with the
literature of his subject , and to
be made aware of newly
published work that is relevant
to his own research." The
problern is also particularly
di f f icul t  for  our c l in ical
colleagues who have additional
clinical re$ponsibilities. How-
ever, the fact remains we must
all aim to keep up with the
literature in our chosen field"

"It is the responsibility of* all
health professionals to evaluate
continually their methods of
treatment and to base clinical
judgements on a body of
knowledge that has been
validated through experimen-
tation " .

L" Makrides & J. Richman

Real ly!
"All knowledge is rgally only
p,rohable knowledge."
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Next year it has been projected
tha"t some 42,000 Americans
will have endos$oous fixtures
implanted, this is an increase of
425Vo since 1985. Not
surpr is ingly a number of
patents have been taken out
dealing with implants during
the past few years. The
German Krupp Company have
taken out a patent for coating
prostheses made from titanium
and titanium alloys (US Patient
# 4,855,101, July 1st ,  1988).
Patents for oral implants were
also taken out by Zimmer Inc.
(US Patent #4,85 4,873, October
13th 1987), and by a Peyton S.
Neuwirth of Stratford I1l. (US
Patent #4,854,87 4 December
1 987). Steven Detsch of
California has also taken out a
patent for a prosthodontic
implant attachment system and
method (US Patent # 4,85 4,872
September 24th 1987).
Currently, there are at least 20
implant systems on the market.
In addit ion to Nobelpharma
USA, the other major company
involved is the Core-Vent Corp.
of Encino, Calif. Together, Core-
Vent and Nobelpharma share
roughly equally between 60
percent and 70 percent of the
implant market in the United
States. The cost of implanting
one tooth or a, small group of
teeth is about $1500 per tooth;
an entire upper or lower set of
teeth can range from $5,000 to
$3,000. 'With this lucrative

market at stake, it was not
surprising that Nobelpharma
and Core-Vent engaged in a
legal battle. In Janu ary 1989
they settled a suit - in which
Nobelpharrna charged Core-
Vent with patent infringement
and unfair marketing practices
a out of court. {Jnder the terms
of their agreemetrt, Nobel-
pharrna granted Core -Vent
licensing rights on certain of its
patents related to dental
implants.

Despite the t ight hold
these two companies have on
the implant markot, there will
be opportunities for companies
with new marketing strategies
to succeed in this arel la.
Improvements in current
surgical techniques and instru-
mentat ion represent opport-
uni t ies for  new companies
entering the market; t Our
proposed new Graduate
Programme in 'Biomaterials
Science'  would have a
significant role to play in this
important area of  heal th
science. Following publicity in
the press the publ ic are
bec omin g increasingly
concerned about the use of
quest ionable mater ia l  s and
devices in the body. There is
clearly a need to to have
scientists trained in the subject
area of biomaterials in order to
monitor and evaluate new
materials coming out onto the
market.
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Cooperat ion
" Scientif ic research is bec-
oming more and more a
cooperative enterprise. Great
inventions and discoveries rest
upon frag men ts of  the
information that issue from a
thousand laboratories. 'We

know Edison invented the
phonograph, but who is the
inventor of television? This
cooperative trend is augm-
ented by the fact that tools of
modern rssearch are often
enormously expensive. The
individual inventor, PUttering
in his basement, can scarce
afford an electron microscope
or cyclotron. To gain access to
these tools he must join the
staff of a, great university or
the research department of a
giant corporation".

Martin Gardner

Clirfigtt. Rese,affCh
"The main purpose of
experimental clinical research
is to enable resoarchers to
make comparisons between
different methods of treatment
and to establish cause/effect
relationships between two or
more variables" As such, the
concept of control is a basic
pre-requis i te to exper imen-
tation because it provides the
necessary basel ine for
comparisons ".

L. Malcrides &, J. Richman

frscgtttstf i ttttt
frREHTSI,,Sf,P:nTIffi
SEA$SI"-I-AISD EH$T
TTISHF$ F'QR A HAPPY
NEW YEAR TO ALL
qH.Q-[JR REAPERSI
#XX#,#*:##,#X###Kx

,{, ,D$lic4tq ,MAttqr
"ft may be said that science has
added to the health and
longevity of the race; that the
progress in surgery,  in
phy$iology, in pathology, in
therapeut ic s,  has great ly
mitigated human suffering and
prolonged l i fe. This is
unquestionably true; but in this
service science is but paying
back with one hand what it
robbed us of with the other.
With i ts appl iances, i ts
machinery, i ts luxurios, i ts
imrnuni t ies, and r* i ts
interference with the law of
natural selection, it has made
the race more delicate and
tender, and if it did not arm
them better against  d isease
also, we should all soon perish."

John Burroughs

SesSqrc,h
"Research can be defined as the
scientif ic method of f inding
answers to que st ion s;  i t
establ ishes the facts which
transform theor ies into
principles".

L. Makrides & J. Richman.
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